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USA TODAY bestselling author Janice Maynard takes readers to a holiday hideaway in her new Billionaires
and Babies book. 

All business, all the time, is billionaire Leo Cavallo's motto. So two months of forced relaxation is certainly
not the CEO's idea of a Christmas bonus. Then he meets his neighbor, the irresistible Phoebe Kemper, and a
storm forces them to become roommates. Suddenly, the holidays are looking a whole lot brighter. 

But beautiful Phoebe isn't living alone. She's babysitting her infant nephew. Somehow, playing temporary
family is surprisingly appealing. But what will Leo choose when it's time to go home?
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From reader reviews:

Kim Scott:

Now a day people that Living in the era where everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not demand people to be aware of each details they get. How a lot more to
be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information mainly this A Billionaire for Christmas (Harlequin
Desire/Billionaires and Babies) book because book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the
information in this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Eileen Lopez:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the subject A Billionaire for
Christmas (Harlequin Desire/Billionaires and Babies) suitable to you? The book was written by popular
writer in this era. Typically the book untitled A Billionaire for Christmas (Harlequin Desire/Billionaires and
Babies)is a single of several books which everyone read now. This particular book was inspired lots of
people in the world. When you read this guide you will enter the new dimension that you ever know previous
to. The author explained their concept in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to understand the core
of this book. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. To help you see the
represented of the world on this book.

Maureen Harris:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you could have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try factor that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you are ride on and with addition info. Even you love A Billionaire for Christmas (Harlequin
Desire/Billionaires and Babies), you are able to enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still want to
miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout men. What? Still don't have it, oh
come on its called reading friends.

Nancy Figaro:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book was rare? Why
so many issue for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some people
likes reading through, not only science book but novel and A Billionaire for Christmas (Harlequin
Desire/Billionaires and Babies) or even others sources were given understanding for you. After you know
how the fantastic a book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher
as well as students especially. Those books are helping them to bring their knowledge. In various other case,
beside science e-book, any other book likes A Billionaire for Christmas (Harlequin Desire/Billionaires and
Babies) to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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