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An early modern domestic and spiritual memoir, My First Booke of My Life depicts the life of Alice
Thornton (1626–1707), a complex, contradictory woman caught in the changing fortunes and social realities
of the seventeenth century. Her memoir documents her perspective on the Irish rebellion and English civil
war as well as on a plethora of domestic dangers and difficulties: from her reluctant marriage, which sought
to rescue the sequestered family estate and clear her brother’s name, to financial crises, to the illnesses and
deaths of several family members and six children, to slanderous criticisms of her fidelity and her parenting.

 

This first complete edition of an autobiographical apologia begins with recollections of Thornton’s childhood
and ends with the death of her husband, restoring almost half of the original text omitted from the
nineteenth-century edition. The image she fashions of a woman devoted to God and family evolves from the
conventional format of the deliverance memoir into a rhetorically sophisticated defense of her life in
response to rumored scandal. Inseparable from the praise of God and family is the distinctive sense of
identity that emerges from the introduction, text, and annotations, all of which provide a significant
contribution to early modern woman’s writing.
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From reader reviews:

George Nygaard:

The feeling that you get from My First Booke of My Life (Early Modern Cultural Studies) will be the more
deep you looking the information that hide within the words the more you get considering reading it. It
doesn't mean that this book is hard to know but My First Booke of My Life (Early Modern Cultural Studies)
giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in specific way that can be
understood by means of anyone who read this because the author of this book is well-known enough. This
particular book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go
with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for having that My First Booke of My
Life (Early Modern Cultural Studies) instantly.

Dave Edwards:

This book untitled My First Booke of My Life (Early Modern Cultural Studies) to be one of several books
which best seller in this year, here is because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit in it.
You will easily to buy this book in the book store or you can order it by way of online. The publisher with
this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, since you can read this book in
your Cell phone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this publication from your list.

Keith Abell:

Exactly why? Because this My First Booke of My Life (Early Modern Cultural Studies) is an unordinary
book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will shock you with the secret
this inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who also write the book in such remarkable way
makes the content within easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning entirely. So ,
it is good for you because of not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This book will give
you a lot of advantages than the other book have such as help improving your proficiency and your critical
thinking approach. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I were being you I will go to the guide
store hurriedly.

Christopher Melendez:

As a university student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library
or to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's internal or
real their hobby. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They go to right now
there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring in addition
to can't see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important to suit your
needs. As we know that on this time, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many ways
to reach Chinese's country. Therefore this My First Booke of My Life (Early Modern Cultural Studies) can
make you sense more interested to read.
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