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This edition includes 11 original interior illustrations by world renowned artist Santiago Caruso.
Bestselling author Joe R. Lansdale (Cold in July, Hap and Leonard series, Bubba Ho-Tep) makes a return to
horror with the dark and intense new novella Prisoner 489 fully illustrated by world-renowned artist Santiago
Caruso.

On an island with a prison for the most evil and powerful criminals in the world, a new prisoner is strapped
to the electric chair for execution. After multiple surges of electricity and nearly knocking out power to the
entire island, the prisoner is finally dead. The staff buries him in the prison graveyard with a simple marker
baring three numbers: 489.

After the body is buried, a violent storm rocks the islands and a staff member goes missing. The crew rushes
into the storm, searching for their lost comrade. They find that the burial site of prisoner 489 has been
unearthed, and the body that was inside has gone missing. With a horrific finding and strange noises around
them, a powerful threat is closing in. It’s a threat that they thought was impossible, and it will force them into
a battle for their lives.

"Veteran horror/thriller author Lansdale (Hot in December) tells a tight, spooky tale about what happens
when an executed prisoner doesn’t stay dead." - Publishers Weekly
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From reader reviews:

John Keys:

Book is usually written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
e-book. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading skill was fluently. A reserve Prisoner 489 (Black Labyrinth Book
2) will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about every
little thing. But some of you think in which open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It's not make
you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you searching for best book or acceptable book with you?

Sheila Kilburn:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you want
something to explain what yours problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy particular person? If
you don't have spare time to complete others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have spare
time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. They have to answer that question since just
their can do which. It said that about book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is correct. Because start
from on guardería until university need this Prisoner 489 (Black Labyrinth Book 2) to read.

Jennifer Wilson:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Make
an effort to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its include may
doesn't work this is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the
outside search likes. Maybe you answer can be Prisoner 489 (Black Labyrinth Book 2) why because the
great cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint a person. The inside or
content is actually fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly direct you
to pick up this book.

Sheila Messina:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you may have it
in e-book way, more simple and reachable. This Prisoner 489 (Black Labyrinth Book 2) can give you a lot of
buddies because by you looking at this one book you have point that they don't and make you more like an
interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for you to get success. This guide offer you
information that maybe your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than other make you to be great
individuals. So , why hesitate? Let us have Prisoner 489 (Black Labyrinth Book 2).
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