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A Death on Skunk Street is the first stand-alone book by Los Angeles poet William S. Friday. Subtitled, “...a
life in poems”, the book is both a remembrance, and a look forward, at what Bernard Malamud (“The
Natural”) called, “The life we learn with... and the life we live after that”. Skunk Street is a work of visions,
written by a blue-collar college drop-out with the eloquence of an angry Psalmist. Parts neon and noir, full
moon and sunsets, and the words that come from feelings too often unexpressed. From loneliness in a sea of
humanity to, comfort in the company of self. There’s blood, and brains, printed on every page. In the
author’s own words... “Somewhere along the way, after all the years and all the experiences, you realize that
the only thing you have to show for them is your recollection of them. And then, you write. So I guess I’d
have to say that I’m the guy who writes what he remembers.” What others are saying about William S.
Friday, and A Death on Skunk Street... “Friday’s collection is a book of ghosts. In it, he gives us the bitter
pill of life and sweetens it with touches of irony and sarcasm, allowing us into, and out of, the poet’s world.”
-Lois P. Jones, Poetry Editor (Kyoto Journal) “A Death on Skunk Street is a purposeful and
uncompromisingly honest introspection... without all the usual... bullshit that passes for poetry today.” -J.W.
Gardner, veterans advocate and author (“In the Shadow of the Bomb”) “I’ve been a fan of Bill’s work for
some time, and now, this collection of highly personal, existential poems. This is what poetry SHOULD be.”
-Julian Gallo, novelist (“Breathe”) “Concise. Emotional. Personal. It’s obvious that the thoughts and feeling
expressed in Bill’s poetry are deeply felt. It’s good work.” -Derrick Ferguson, author and creator (the
“Dillon” series)
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From reader reviews:

Adria Jenkins:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be up-date about what going on or data even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era that is certainly always change and make progress. Some of
you maybe will update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems
coming to you is you don't know which you should start with. This A Death on Skunk Street: A life in poems
is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want
and want in this era.

Wendy Kroll:

Many people spending their period by playing outside having friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by reading a book. Ugh,
do you consider reading a book can really hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It fine you
can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like A Death on Skunk Street: A
life in poems which is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's view.

Michael Banks:

Is it you who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by means of watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This A Death on Skunk Street: A life in poems
can be the reply, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are so out of date, spending your free time by
reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?

John Yates:

A lot of book has printed but it differs. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the most
beneficial book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is identified
as of book A Death on Skunk Street: A life in poems. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without
leaving behind the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is
most important that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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