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Annatha Wolcott, a rebellious young woman, seeks to terminate an unplanned pregnancy. She inadvertently
meets Wendy Malloy, a zealous pro-lifer who has other plans and lures her into a trap from which there is no
escape.

Annatha's disappearance lands in the lap of FBI agent Rachel Ward who works tirelessly to find the missing
girl. A pregnancy complication threatens to undo Wendy's plans and unbeknownst to agent Ward, turns the
investigation into a race against time.

Each character is faced with difficult situations that seem irreconcilable. The characters in Gestation must
choose their paths in the hope of finding the one with least resistance. However, sometimes the supposed
easier way leads them to what appears to be insurmountable odds.

As often happens, their choices clash and a battle of wills results with no consideration for compromise.
When an unborn life is involved, personal judgments and morality create the foundation from which their
actions are justified and even glorified as divine. In Gestation, you will journey through the lives of these
characters who suffer nightmarish consequences from their life choices.
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From reader reviews:

Lee Parkin:

This book untitled Gestation: Unborn Hostage to be one of several books that will best seller in this year, this
is because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this book in
the book retail outlet or you can order it by means of online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too.
It makes you easier to read this book, because you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no
reason to you to past this guide from your list.

Dawn Dustin:

Often the book Gestation: Unborn Hostage has a lot info on it. So when you check out this book you can get
a lot of benefit. The book was authored by the very famous author. The writer makes some research previous
to write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily after scanning this
book.

Frank Godwin:

The book untitled Gestation: Unborn Hostage contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains
your ex idea with easy method. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so do certainly not
worry, you can easy to read this. The book was published by famous author. The author will bring you in the
new period of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can continue reading your smart
phone, or program, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you
can start their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice study.

James Valenzuela:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our know-how for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year ended up
being exactly added. This reserve Gestation: Unborn Hostage was filled about science. Spend your extra time
to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has various feel when they
reading some sort of book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a publication.
In the modern era like today, many ways to get book you wanted.
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