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For decades, guitar students and teachers alike have struggled with the idea of left-handed individuals
playing right-handed. Now that the idea of letting the dominant hand rule is widely accepted as the best
course of action, here at last is a proven method for the left-handed guitarist! The world’s premier method for
learning modern plectrum style guitar, time-tested and proven successful in building the theoretic and
technical foundation needed to play in any style is now available for the left-handed guitarist! All seven
grades of this method are written in standard notation only to encourage better sight reading. In Grade 1, the
student guitarist will learn to play solos, duets, scales, and chords in the keys of C, A minor, G and E minor.
Even in Grade 1, the student is already exposed to the chord/melody concept of guitar performance. A
supplementary study book entitled Grade 1 Studies is available and recommended. The companion
recordings feature Tommy Flint and William Bay performing the solos, studies and duets contained in this
method. The Left-Handed Modern Guitar Method Grade 1 provides valuable enhancement to the world’s
most popular guitar method. Includes access to an online audio recording.
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From reader reviews:

Sharon Bufkin:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students as they are still students or that for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they
don't need do that. You must know how great and also important the book Left-Handed Modern Guitar
Method Grade 1. All type of book is it possible to see on many solutions. You can look for the internet
methods or other social media.

Joyce Volz:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a e-book you will get new information due to the fact book is one of many ways to share the
information or their idea. Second, looking at a book will make a person more imaginative. When you
examining a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the
personas do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read
this Left-Handed Modern Guitar Method Grade 1, it is possible to tells your family, friends as well as soon
about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a reserve.

Siobhan Wilcox:

Left-Handed Modern Guitar Method Grade 1 can be one of your nice books that are good idea. We all
recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary which could increase your knowledge
in words, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort
to put every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Left-Handed Modern Guitar Method Grade 1 yet
doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource data that maybe
you can be among it. This great information can drawn you into completely new stage of crucial
contemplating.

Kenneth Lambert:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside along with friends, fun activity using family or
just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by looking at a
book. Ugh, ya think reading a book can really hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It fine
you can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Left-Handed Modern
Guitar Method Grade 1 which is finding the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.
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