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A teen idol of the 1950s who virtually invented the singer/songwriter/heartthrob combination that still tops
pop music today, Paul Anka rocketed to fame with a slew of hits-from "Diana" to "Put Your Head on my
Shoulder"-that earned him a place touring with the major stars of his era, including Chuck Berry, Jerry Lee
Lewis, and Buddy Holly. He wrote Holly's last hit, and just missed joining the rocker on his final, fatal plane
flight. Anka also stepped in front of the camera in the teen beach-party movie era, scoring the movies and
romancing their starlets, including Annette Funicello.

When the British invasion made his fans swoon for a new style of music-and musician--Anka made sure he
wasn't conquered. A rapier-canny businessman and image-builder who took his career into his own hands-
just as he had from the very beginning, swiping his mother's car at fourteen to drive himself, underage, to his
first gigs in Quebec-Anka toured the world until he could return home in triumph. A charter member of the
Rat Pack, he wrote the theme music for The Tonight Show as well as his friend Frank Sinatra's anthem "My
Way". By the 1970s, a multi-decade string of pop chart-toppers, including "Puppy Love" and "(You're)
Having My Baby", cemented his status as an icon.
My Way is bursting with rich, rollicking stories of the business and the people in Anka's life: Elizabeth
Taylor, Dodi Fayed, Tom Jones, Michael Jackson, Adnan Khashoggi, Little Richard, Brooke Shields, Johnny
Roselli, Sammy Davis, Jr., Brigitte Bardot, Barnum & Bailey Circus acrobats, and many more. Anka is
forthcoming, funny and smart as a whip about the business he's been in for almost six decades. My Way
moves from New York to Vegas, from the casino stage to backstages all over the world. It's the most
entertaining autobiography of the year.
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From reader reviews:

Helen McCormick:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book particularly book entitled My
Way: An Autobiography your mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each aspect that
maybe mysterious for but surely will become your mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a
publication then become one type conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get before. The My
Way: An Autobiography giving you another experience more than blown away your thoughts but also giving
you useful details for your better life within this era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern at this point
is your body and mind will probably be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning a. Do you
want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?

Charles Stephens:

My Way: An Autobiography can be one of your basic books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that
straight away because this guide has good vocabulary which could increase your knowledge in vocabulary,
easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The article author giving his/her
effort that will put every word into delight arrangement in writing My Way: An Autobiography however
doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource details
that maybe you can be among it. This great information could drawn you into fresh stage of crucial
pondering.

Kimberly Dyson:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
skill or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your short period of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only
find e-book that need more time to be study. My Way: An Autobiography can be your answer since it can be
read by an individual who have those short extra time problems.

Louis Hudson:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside along with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by looking at a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book really can hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It ok you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like My Way: An
Autobiography which is getting the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's see.
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