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Assessing and managing risk is a daily challenge for social workers. Working with risk can be anxiety
provoking and demanding, requiring great skill and high levels of confidence. In these complex situations,
social workers have to work hard to get the balance right.

This innovative book focuses on the development and use of skills for work with risk. Using a range of case
studies, examples and reflective exercises, the authors examine the key skills required to work effectively
with risk. Various chapters focus on assessment skills, gathering and evaluation of information, decision-
making challenges, and ethical issues. Recognising the difficulties presented in the context of busy statutory
work, there is a strong focus on practical skills and tips for improving risk management plans. The book also
pays careful attention to the emotional impact of working with risk, with a final chapter on the management
of self in the challenging and sometimes distressing world of social work.

Written in a reader-friendly, accessible style, the book will be essential reading for students and staff across a
range of social work settings, including community care, adult services, child protection and mental health.
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From reader reviews:

Marie Williams:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a book. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you
can add your knowledge by the publication entitled Working with Risk: Skills for Contemporary Social
Work. Try to make the book Working with Risk: Skills for Contemporary Social Work as your friend. It
means that it can being your friend when you truly feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter
than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you more confidence because you
can know every little thing by the book. So , we should make new experience along with knowledge with
this book.

Daniel Starnes:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on
guys this particular aren't like that. This Working with Risk: Skills for Contemporary Social Work book is
readable by you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable
reading experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer
connected with Working with Risk: Skills for Contemporary Social Work content conveys prospect easily to
understand by lots of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content material but it just
different in the form of it. So , do you continue to thinking Working with Risk: Skills for Contemporary
Social Work is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Kirk Qualls:

Beside this kind of Working with Risk: Skills for Contemporary Social Work in your phone, it could give
you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you might got
here is fresh from your oven so don't always be worry if you feel like an older people live in narrow small
town. It is good thing to have Working with Risk: Skills for Contemporary Social Work because this book
offers for your requirements readable information. Do you at times have book but you seldom get what it's
all about. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this with your hand. The Enjoyable
arrangement here cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss it?
Find this book and read it from right now!

Cathy Duran:

A lot of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt it when they
get a half parts of the book. You can choose the book Working with Risk: Skills for Contemporary Social
Work to make your own personal reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading skill is developing
when you just like reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the
feeling about book and examining especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to open a book and



study it. Beside that the reserve Working with Risk: Skills for Contemporary Social Work can to be a newly
purchased friend when you're sense alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of that time.
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