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Contents Shibboleth: For Paul Celan A Self-Unsealing Poetic Text: Poetics and Politics of Witnessing
Language Does Not Belong: An Interview The Majesty of the Present: Reading Celan's The MeridianRams:
Uninterrupted Dialogue-between Two Infinities, the PoemThis book brings together five powerful
encounters. Themes central to all ofDerrida's writings thread the intense confrontation between the most
famousphilosopher of our time and the Jewish poet writing in German who, perhapsmore powerfully than
any other, has testified to the European experience ofthe twentieth century.They include the date or signature
and its singularity; the notion of the trace;temporal structures of futurity and the to come; the multiplicity of
languageand questions of translation; such speech acts as testimony and promising, butalso lying and
perjury; the possibility of the impossible; and, above all, the questionof the poem as addressed and destined
beyond knowledge, seeking to speak toand for the irreducibly other.The memory of encounters with thinkers
who have also engaged Celan's workanimates these writings, which include a brilliant dialogue between
twointerpretative modes-hermeneutics and deconstruction. Derrida's approach toa poem is a revelation on
many levels, from the most concrete ways of reading-for example, his analysis of a sequence of personal
pronouns-to the mostsweeping imperatives of human existence (and Derrida's writings are alwaysa study in
the imbrication of such levels). Above all, he voices the call toresponsibility in the ultimate line of Celan's
poem: The world is gone,I must carry you,which sounds throughout the book's final essay like a refrain.
Only two of the texts in this volume do not appear here in English for the first time. Of these, Schibboleth
has been entirely retranslated and has been set following Derrida's own instructions for publication in
French; A Self-Unsealing Poetic Textwas substantially rewritten by Derrida himself and basically appears
here as the translation of a new text. Jacques Derrida's most recent books in English translation include
Counterpath: Traveling with Jacques Derrida (with Catherine Malabou). He died in Paris on October 8,
2004. Thomas Dutoit teaches at the Universit de Paris 7. He translated Aporias and edited On the Name, both
by Jacques Derrida.
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From reader reviews:

Lucile Brown:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, small story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not trying Sovereignties in Question: The
Poetics of Paul Celan (Perspectives in Continental Philosophy) that give your satisfaction preference will be
satisfied by reading this book. Reading addiction all over the world can be said as the method for people to
know world far better then how they react to the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading habit
only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for every you who want
to start looking at as your good habit, you may pick Sovereignties in Question: The Poetics of Paul Celan
(Perspectives in Continental Philosophy) become your starter.

Jerry Bates:

Does one one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Make an effort to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't assess book by its protect may
doesn't work at this point is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic
as in the outside seem likes. Maybe you answer might be Sovereignties in Question: The Poetics of Paul
Celan (Perspectives in Continental Philosophy) why because the fantastic cover that make you consider in
regards to the content will not disappoint an individual. The inside or content is usually fantastic as the
outside or maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly assist you to pick up this book.

Todd Goff:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our understanding for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we wish. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year seemed
to be exactly added. This book Sovereignties in Question: The Poetics of Paul Celan (Perspectives in
Continental Philosophy) was filled concerning science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your
scientific research competence. Some people has different feel when they reading any book. If you know
how big benefit from a book, you can experience enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like
currently, many ways to get book which you wanted.

Isaac Lewis:

That book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Sovereignties in Question: The Poetics of Paul
Celan (Perspectives in Continental Philosophy) was bright colored and of course has pictures on there. As we
know that book Sovereignties in Question: The Poetics of Paul Celan (Perspectives in Continental
Philosophy) has many kinds or type. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you
can read and believe that you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are generally make you
bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to
like reading which.
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