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The ultimate in GMAT Verbal preparation, with over 300 practice questions and answers

The Official Guide for the GMAT Verbal Review 2017 provides practical preparation focused on the verbal
portion of the exam. Written by the Graduate Management Admission Council, this guide is designed to
provide targeted review based on your needs. You’ll review the fundamentals of reading comprehension,
grammar, and critical reasoning, and learn just what the test is measuring so you can tailor your approach for
each question type. Over 300 additional practice questions—45 of them brand new to this edition—allow
you to test your understanding, with full answers and thorough explanations to help you pinpoint where you
need to improve. The companion website (gmat.wiley.com) allows you to create personalized practice sets,
so you can get more out of your study time by skipping what you know and focusing on what you don’t. You
also get access to practice exams and videos featuring valuable insight and advice to help you be fully
prepared on exam day.

Hone your skills and build your confidence with essential review, valuable insight, and plenty of practice,
fully customizable to your specific needs.

Brush up on grammar, reading comprehension, and critical reasoning skills●

Learn helpful tips and strategies specific to the GMAT verbal section●

Create custom practice sets to target your weaker areas●

Practice over 300 verbal questions from past exams●

You read, write, and think every day, so you think you’re prepared for the GMAT Verbal—but are you
really? With less than two minutes per question, you need a clear plan and reflexive understanding. This
book gives you both, with advice straight from the exam’s creators. The Official Guide for the GMAT Verbal
Review 2017 is your ideal resource for complete and thorough preparation.
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From reader reviews:

Marvin Gamez:

Reading a book to be new life style in this year; every people loves to go through a book. When you examine
a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of
book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your review, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics,
as well as soon. The The Official Guide for GMAT Verbal Review 2017 with Online Question Bank and
Exclusive Video will give you new experience in reading through a book.

Troy Harlow:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you may
have it in e-book technique, more simple and reachable. That The Official Guide for GMAT Verbal Review
2017 with Online Question Bank and Exclusive Video can give you a lot of good friends because by you
taking a look at this one book you have issue that they don't and make anyone more like an interesting
person. This particular book can be one of a step for you to get success. This publication offer you
information that perhaps your friend doesn't understand, by knowing more than some other make you to be
great individuals. So , why hesitate? Let's have The Official Guide for GMAT Verbal Review 2017 with
Online Question Bank and Exclusive Video.

Marilynn Johnson:

You can find this The Official Guide for GMAT Verbal Review 2017 with Online Question Bank and
Exclusive Video by go to the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be
your solve issue if you get difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not only by
simply written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era including
now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your own
personal ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange yourself to make
your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose right ways for you.

Monique Hightower:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many problem for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some
people likes studying, not only science book and also novel and The Official Guide for GMAT Verbal
Review 2017 with Online Question Bank and Exclusive Video or maybe others sources were given
understanding for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you feel desire to read more and more.
Science publication was created for teacher or students especially. Those books are helping them to put their
knowledge. In various other case, beside science book, any other book likes The Official Guide for GMAT



Verbal Review 2017 with Online Question Bank and Exclusive Video to make your spare time more
colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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