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Jane Austen's classic tale of mischief and budding romance comes to life! In the village of Highbury, young
Emma Woodhouse is an expert in romance. believing herself a matchmaker, she employs her knack for
pairing people atevery opportunity. according to her, she hasn't been wrong yet, and the mere thought she
could be is quite preposterous. When a single young lady - Harriet Smith - arrives in Highbury, Emma is
determined to find her a suitable gentleman caller. between card parties, suppers and carriage drives,
everything seems to be going according to plan. however, love has other intentions! With her schemes
backfiring in ways she could not anticipate, Emma finds her meddling is leading to heartbreak - her own!
Can she set aside her agenda before true love goes asunder? Award-winning writer nancy butler - adapter of
Marvel's best-selling Pride and Prejudice and Sense and Sensibility - brings you another Jane Austen classic,
breathing life into the author's most precocious heroine. discover what has made this story so enduring, as it's
retold in the Mighty Marvel Manner with the beautiful illustrations of Janet Lee! COLLECTING: Emma 1-
5
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From reader reviews:

Edward Rideout:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them loved ones or
their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or playing video
games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different you can read a
new book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent the entire day to
reading a book. The book Emma (Marvel Classics (Paperback)) it doesn't matter what good to read. There
are a lot of those who recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. If you did not have
enough space to bring this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book
from a smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book provides high quality.

Angela Dickens:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book than can satisfy
your short period of time to read it because all this time you only find book that need more time to be go
through. Emma (Marvel Classics (Paperback)) can be your answer since it can be read by a person who have
those short spare time problems.

Melanie Moore:

Is it anyone who having spare time after that spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or
just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Emma (Marvel Classics (Paperback)) can
be the reply, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your extra time by
reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?

Sonia Cancel:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got college students? We believe that that
query was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And
you also know that little person similar to reading or as reading become their hobby. You must know that
reading is very important and book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except
your own teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update about something by book. Different categories of
books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them are these claims Emma (Marvel Classics
(Paperback)).
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