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You’re young, adventurous, and horny. And you have the day off. Outside your door, a world of possibility
awaits; all you need to do is decide what –and who—you want to do. In your quest for love you’ll traverse
catacombs while fending off vampires, outwit a seductive spy aboard Air Force One, tangle with a lecherous
ghost, and even travel to Hell and back. Make the wrong decision and you’ll end up in a casket. Choose
wisely, however, and you might get laid and still make it home in time to feed your cat.

A sexy spin on classic Choose Your Own Adventure books, BIRTHDAY BOY combines the traditional
page-hopping choices of the genre with entertaining erotica written especially for men who like their
nostalgia naughty. Eighteen unique sexual partners and fifty endings are yours to explore as you turn the
pages. Your fate, and who knows what else, is in your hands!
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From reader reviews:

Sandy Gonsalves:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive at this point,
people have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded
place and notice by simply surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the
idea for a while is reading. Yes, by reading a reserve your ability to survive raise then having chance to stay
than other is high. For you personally who want to start reading a book, we give you this Birthday Boy (Get
Off or Die Trying Books 1) book as nice and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is more than
just a book.

Percy Cole:

This book untitled Birthday Boy (Get Off or Die Trying Books 1) to be one of several books that best seller
in this year, that is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily
to buy this particular book in the book shop or you can order it by way of online. The publisher on this book
sells the e-book too. It makes you more readily to read this book, since you can read this book in your
Mobile phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this guide from your list.

Dolores Wade:

Reading a book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With examining you can get a
lot of information that can give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can
certainly share their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their
particular reader with their story or their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the publications. But
also they write about the ability about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score
toefl, or how to teach your kids, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on this planet
always try to improve their expertise in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write to their
book. One of them is this Birthday Boy (Get Off or Die Trying Books 1).

Bertram Staten:

A lot of reserve has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by world wide web on social
media. You can choose the very best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by searching from
it. It is called of book Birthday Boy (Get Off or Die Trying Books 1). You can contribute your knowledge by
it. Without causing the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is
most critical that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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