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This book provides a comprehensive presentation of the most advanced research results and technological
developments enabling understanding, qualifying and mitigating the soft errors effect in advanced
electronics, including the fundamental physical mechanisms of radiation induced soft errors, the various
steps that lead to a system failure, the modelling and simulation of soft error at various levels (including
physical, electrical, netlist, event driven, RTL, and system level modelling and simulation), hardware fault
injection, accelerated radiation testing and natural environment testing, soft error oriented test structures,
process-level, device-level, cell-level, circuit-level, architectural-level, software level and system level soft
error mitigation techniques.

The book contains a comprehensive presentation of most recent advances on understanding, qualifying and
mitigating the soft error effect in advanced electronic systems, presented by academia and industry experts in
reliability, fault tolerance, EDA, processor, SoC and system design, and in particular, experts from industries
that have faced the soft error impact in terms of product reliability and related business issues and were in the
forefront of the countermeasures taken by these companies at multiple levels in order to mitigate the soft
error effects at a cost acceptable for commercial products. In a fast moving field, where the impact on ground
level electronics is very recent and its severity is steadily increasing at each new process node, impacting one
after another various industry sectors (as an example, the Automotive Electronics Council comes to publish
qualification requirements on soft errors), research and technology developments and industrial practices
have evolve very fast, outdating the most recent books edited at 2004.
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From reader reviews:

Frank Craver:

This Soft Errors in Modern Electronic Systems: 41 (Frontiers in Electronic Testing) usually are reliable for
you who want to be described as a successful person, why. The key reason why of this Soft Errors in Modern
Electronic Systems: 41 (Frontiers in Electronic Testing) can be on the list of great books you must have is
giving you more than just simple reading food but feed a person with information that maybe will shock your
previous knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and whenever your
conditions in the e-book and printed ones. Beside that this Soft Errors in Modern Electronic Systems: 41
(Frontiers in Electronic Testing) giving you an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving
you tryout of critical thinking that could it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Pearl Moore:

Why? Because this Soft Errors in Modern Electronic Systems: 41 (Frontiers in Electronic Testing) is an
unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap it but latter it will jolt you with the secret
it inside. Reading this book alongside it was fantastic author who all write the book in such remarkable way
makes the content inside easier to understand, entertaining method but still convey the meaning entirely. So ,
it is good for you because of not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This phenomenal
book will give you a lot of rewards than the other book have got such as help improving your proficiency
and your critical thinking method. So , still want to delay having that book? If I were you I will go to the
reserve store hurriedly.

Shirley Henderson:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you might have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try factor that really
opposite from that. 1 activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you already been ride on and with addition details. Even you love Soft Errors in Modern Electronic Systems:
41 (Frontiers in Electronic Testing), you could enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still want to miss
it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't buy it, oh come
on its referred to as reading friends.

Carla Helton:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got college students? We believe that that
question was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And
also you know that little person including reading or as studying become their hobby. You must know that
reading is very important as well as book as to be the point. Book is important thing to include you
knowledge, except your current teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update about something by book.
Amount types of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is this Soft Errors in
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