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A brutal murder, a nefarious plot, a coded letter. After five hundred years, the most notorious mystery
of the Renaissance is finally solved.

The Italian Renaissance is remembered as much for intrigue as it is for art, with papal politics and infighting
among Italy’s many city-states providing the grist for Machiavelli’s classic work on take-no-prisoners
politics, The Prince. The attempted assassination of the Medici brothers in the Duomo in Florence in 1478 is
one of the best-known examples of the machinations endemic to the age. While the assailants were the
Medici’s rivals, the Pazzi family, questions have always lingered about who really orchestrated the attack,
which has come to be known as the Pazzi Conspiracy.

More than five hundred years later, Marcello Simonetta, working in a private archive in Italy, stumbled upon
a coded letter written by Federico da Montefeltro, the Duke of Urbino, to Pope Sixtus IV. Using a codebook
written by his own ancestor to crack its secrets, Simonetta unearthed proof of an all-out power grab by the
Pope for control of Florence. Montefeltro, long believed to be a close friend of Lorenzo de Medici, was in
fact conspiring with the Pope to unseat the Medici and put the more malleable Pazzi in their place.

In The Montefeltro Conspiracy, Simonetta unravels this plot, showing not only how the plot came together
but how its failure (only one of the Medici brothers, Giuliano, was killed; Lorenzo survived) changed the
course of Italian and papal history for generations. In the course of his gripping narrative, we encounter the
period’s most colorful characters, relive its tumultuous politics, and discover that two famous paintings,
including one in the Sistine Chapel, contain the Medici’s astounding revenge.
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From reader reviews:

Trevor Wright:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite publication and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the publication entitled The Montefeltro Conspiracy: A Renaissance Mystery Decoded. Try to
the actual book The Montefeltro Conspiracy: A Renaissance Mystery Decoded as your good friend. It means
that it can being your friend when you feel alone and beside that course make you smarter than in the past.
Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know
everything by the book. So , let's make new experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Jose Gray:

The Montefeltro Conspiracy: A Renaissance Mystery Decoded can be one of your starter books that are good
idea. We all recommend that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that may increase your
knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the information.
The article author giving his/her effort to get every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing The
Montefeltro Conspiracy: A Renaissance Mystery Decoded however doesn't forget the main level, giving the
reader the hottest and also based confirm resource details that maybe you can be considered one of it. This
great information can certainly drawn you into completely new stage of crucial considering.

Bertha Boone:

Reading a book to be new life style in this year; every people loves to read a book. When you study a book
you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of
book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your research, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, such us novel, comics, along with soon. The
The Montefeltro Conspiracy: A Renaissance Mystery Decoded offer you a new experience in reading
through a book.

Phyllis Granger:

With this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more special than
other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you are related
is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of many books
in the top record in your reading list is usually The Montefeltro Conspiracy: A Renaissance Mystery
Decoded. This book which is qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in becoming precious
person. By looking way up and review this e-book you can get many advantages.
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