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It never hurts to be rich, but . . .

LOVE, LIES AND HIGH HEELS is book 1 in the Spoiled and Sassy series. Although it is a standalone
book, the series showcases women who realize money can’t buy love.

Who would have guessed a lie could bring them together?

LUKE GALLOWAY doesn’t lie. Well, not normally. And never about anything as serious as death. But,
somehow Luke’s friend and business partner, Sam Paris, convinces Luke he needs to do just that. Sam
believes the only way his daughter will come back to see him is if he were dying. And so the lies begin . . .

RUSTY PARIS has been alone most of her life. Her parents were divorced when she was very young. She
was pushed off to boarding schools, while her mother made a hobby of marrying rich men. She doesn’t
remember much about her father, only that he never made an attempt to be a part of her life for the past
twenty-one years. But all that is about to change. When she gets word he is dying, she runs home to be by his
side, which puts her right in the path of that scoundrel Luke Galloway.

Luke has no room in his life for rich heiresses. Been there. Done that. From the first time Luke and Rusty
meet, they clash. She considers him nothing more than a lowly ranch hand who enjoys riling her temper. He
finds her arrogant and prissy. But that doesn’t mean he can fight his attraction to her, nor hers to him. And
when they find out they’ve both been duped by Rusty’s father the sparks really start to fly.

Book 1 – Spoiled and Sassy series – LOVE, LIES AND HIGH HEELS
Book 2 – Spoiled and Sassy series – BAILIEY’S IRISH DREAM
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From reader reviews:

Arturo Hasan:

Book is written, printed, or created for everything. You can learn everything you want by a guide. Book has
a different type. As it is known to us that book is important factor to bring us around the world. Close to that
you can your reading skill was fluently. A publication LOVE, LIES AND HIGH HEELS (SPOILED AND
SASSY Book 1) will make you to always be smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know
about every little thing. But some of you think this open or reading the book make you bored. It is not make
you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or suited book with you?

Rose Nguyen:

Do you among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on guys this
kind of aren't like that. This LOVE, LIES AND HIGH HEELS (SPOILED AND SASSY Book 1) book is
readable by simply you who hate those straight word style. You will find the information here are arrange for
enjoyable studying experience without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you.
The writer of LOVE, LIES AND HIGH HEELS (SPOILED AND SASSY Book 1) content conveys the
thought easily to understand by lots of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it
just different such as it. So , do you continue to thinking LOVE, LIES AND HIGH HEELS (SPOILED AND
SASSY Book 1) is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Michelle Huffman:

LOVE, LIES AND HIGH HEELS (SPOILED AND SASSY Book 1) can be one of your beginner books that
are good idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this publication has good vocabulary that can
increase your knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the
information. The article author giving his/her effort to get every word into satisfaction arrangement in
writing LOVE, LIES AND HIGH HEELS (SPOILED AND SASSY Book 1) yet doesn't forget the main
position, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource info that maybe you can be
among it. This great information can drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial thinking.

Richard Ma:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and
soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended to your account is LOVE, LIES AND HIGH HEELS (SPOILED AND SASSY Book 1) this
publication consist a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. This kind of book was
represented how does the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer value to explain it is easy to
understand. The writer made some exploration when he makes this book. That's why this book suited all of



you.
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