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Charlene Ward was born and raised in the rural area on North Carolina. She is the youngest of 11 siblings.
While growing up, Charlene learned to appreciate God and what He means to her. Charlene graduated with a
Bachelor's Degree in Social Work. She faithfully believes in the motto "helping others help themselves." She
feels that her education has given her the knowledge about life and people, but her greatest learning was of
the word of God. She says her desire to learn more of God gave her the motivation to reach out and help
others. She received a certificated of completion from the Daniel's School of Prophets in 2011. She later
went on to graduate from the Bethel School of the Bible in 2012 where she enhanced her knowledge about
the Bible.

Charlene is the author and poet of the book entitled "Fruits of the Spirit," her very first project. She is a
devoted church member working as a youth leader who loves the Lord and she is not ashamed of the Gospel
of Jesus Christ.
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From reader reviews:

Kathy Hunnicutt:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book called Wrapped in The
Father's Arms? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time along
with your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have various
other opinion?

Kristy Taylor:

The e-book with title Wrapped in The Father's Arms has lot of information that you can learn it. You can get
a lot of help after read this book. This particular book exist new information the information that exist in this
book represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to be aware of how the
improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you within new era of the glowbal growth. You can
read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Kevin Kennard:

This Wrapped in The Father's Arms is great e-book for you because the content that is certainly full of
information for you who have always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This
specific book reveal it details accurately using great plan word or we can point out no rambling sentences
inside it. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you
straight forward sentences but challenging core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having
Wrapped in The Father's Arms in your hand like getting the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous
one. We can say that no publication that offer you world inside ten or fifteen minute right but this e-book
already do that. So , this is certainly good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt which?

Rosa Milliken:

You may spend your free time to learn this book this publication. This Wrapped in The Father's Arms is
simple to bring you can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not include
much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you quicker to read
it. You can save the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get
when you buy this book.
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