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The tales and travels of the Sugar Creek Gang have passed the test of time, delighting young readers
for more than fifty years.

Great mysteries with a message for kids, The Sugar Creek Gang series chronicles the faith-building
adventures of a group of fun-loving, courageous Christian boys. Your kids will be thrilled, chilled, and
inspired to grow as they follow the legendary escapades of Bill Collins, Dragonfly, and the rest of the gang
as they struggle with the application of their Christian faith to the adventure of life.

In this book, the Sugar Creek Gang discovers a "disguise" hidden in a old tree. Does it belong to the bank
robber hiding in the swamp? A mysterious map hidden near the tree proves to be even more exciting than the
disguise. Before the adventure ends, the gang encounters the robber, helps Bill Collins welcome a new baby
sister, and saves the victim of a black widow spider bite. Join the gang as they learn the lesson of sowing and
reaping.
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From reader reviews:

Gerardo Whittaker:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a book. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the guide entitled The Swamp Robber (Sugar Creek Gang, Book 1). Try to stumble through
book The Swamp Robber (Sugar Creek Gang, Book 1) as your buddy. It means that it can for being your
friend when you truly feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is
very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know every
little thing by the book. So , let me make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Daniel Hendrix:

The book The Swamp Robber (Sugar Creek Gang, Book 1) make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You
should use to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting strain
or having big problem with the subject. If you can make reading through a book The Swamp Robber (Sugar
Creek Gang, Book 1) to get your habit, you can get much more advantages, like add your personal capable,
increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You can know everything if you like available and read
a reserve The Swamp Robber (Sugar Creek Gang, Book 1). Kinds of book are several. It means that, science
book or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this book?

Robert Nguyen:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside having friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
do you consider reading a book really can hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It alright
you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like The Swamp Robber (Sugar
Creek Gang, Book 1) which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's view.

Tammy Ely:

Reserve is one of source of expertise. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen want book to know the change information of year to help year. As we know
those publications have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the
world. With the book The Swamp Robber (Sugar Creek Gang, Book 1) we can consider more advantage.
Don't someone to be creative people? To become creative person must want to read a book. Just choose the
best book that suited with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life with that book The Swamp Robber
(Sugar Creek Gang, Book 1). You can more attractive than now.
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