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Deep within the fortress of Pandora, Lieutenant Vane Schiva has spent millennium guarding precious
artifacts and ancient secrets from around the universe. As the son of a decorated commander, he has always
been a soldier first, putting the needs of his people before his own desires. So when the compound is
breached and he’s sent across the galaxies to track down the thief, he never imagined the assignment would
lead him to the only thing he’s ever wanted for himself. Growing up in New Orleans, Charlotte Rousseau has
seen her share of the strange and unexplainable, but everything she thought she knew about the world is
about to be tested. What started as any other day, quickly spirals into a nightmarish reality, leaving her no
choice but to place her trust—and her life—in a stranger’s hands. Safety comes at a price, though, and
Charlotte soon realizes her only chance at survival means leaving behind her fears and following Vane into
the fire. Faced with the threat of war, new alliances are formed and old loyalties are tested in the midst of
chaos and uncertainty. While emotions run high and sexual tensions simmer, Vane still guards a dangerous
secret, one that could cost him everything in the end. He’ll do whatever it takes to protect Charlotte, though,
even if that means turning his back on his own people. War is easy. Love takes courage.
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From reader reviews:

Aline Moran:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive now, people have do
something to make these survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice by simply
surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated the item for a while is reading.
That's why, by reading a publication your ability to survive raise then having chance to endure than other is
high. For you who want to start reading a book, we give you this Timeless (Pandora) (Volume 1) book as
beginning and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Arthur Dickison:

Timeless (Pandora) (Volume 1) can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. We all recommend
that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary which could increase your knowledge in vocab,
easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The author giving his/her
effort to set every word into pleasure arrangement in writing Timeless (Pandora) (Volume 1) but doesn't
forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource details that maybe you
can be certainly one of it. This great information can easily drawn you into brand new stage of crucial
imagining.

Rita Campanelli:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book as
compared to can satisfy your short space of time to read it because all of this time you only find book that
need more time to be examine. Timeless (Pandora) (Volume 1) can be your answer because it can be read by
you who have those short spare time problems.

Irma Lovern:

As we know that book is important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we want. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year has been
exactly added. This reserve Timeless (Pandora) (Volume 1) was filled in relation to science. Spend your
extra time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has several feel when they
reading some sort of book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a book.
In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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